
‭G‬‭OLD‬‭M‬‭EDAL‬‭W‬‭RESTLING‬
‭Date: Sunday, October 20th‬
‭2024-2025  Board Meeting #3‬
‭Time: 5:00‬
‭Location:‬‭Club 51‬
‭Meeting Agenda / Minutes‬

‭Attendees:‬‭Chelsea Orvick, Robin Herring, Tyler Rauls,‬‭March Hinz, Kristine Frye‬

‭1.‬ ‭Treasurer's Report‬‭Current balance $31,014.09‬

‭2.‬ ‭Middle School update via email from Damon on 10/17‬‭:‬‭As for the middle school “stuff”…we have 27‬
‭kids registered and about 20 showed up for the first practice.  I know of the 27 kids there are 3‬
‭that are injured and probably won’t wrestle.  Others that didn’t show up had prior commitments‬
‭and hopefully join the team soon.  It looks like we have a good mix of littles up through two big‬
‭guys.  We also have 2 managers.   Should be a fun year.  Could still use another full’ish time‬
‭coach…right now it’s me, Dale, and Jon Lauersdorf.  The new gear we ordered has arrived.  The‬
‭only thing I can think of that we may need, but should be okay this year, is new head gear if we‬
‭are going to continue to offer to provide that?  As for the jerky fundraiser…I apologize as I sort of‬
‭let this slip through the cracks as I got busy with other things.‬

‭3.‬ ‭High School Report‬
‭a.‬ ‭Registration numbers (Boys / Girls)‬‭Date of meeting‬‭there were 44 registered for the HS team.‬
‭b.‬ ‭Mat Tape - ordered - waiting on the invoice.‬‭Will‬‭be delivered to high school.‬
‭c.‬ ‭Girls uniforms “Bundle 3” approved via Email (attached)‬‭Chelsea and Tyler spoke after the HS‬

‭team meeting. The girls team is expected to possibly have a full roster, via email 10/23/24 Chelsea‬
‭motioned to approve an increase from 12 bundles of uniforms to 18 bundles. The total cost would‬
‭be $2952.00.  This will ensure there are enough uniforms for the HS girls team. The HS will also be‬
‭contributing to the uniform cost per AD Henert, contribution amount is unknown at this time,‬
‭possibly $500-$800. HS team is also signed up to work concessions on 11/1 for HS boys soccer‬
‭game to earn funding towards HS team. Tyler is also planning on a beef jerky fundraiser for the‬
‭team to help contribute. As of 10/24 there are 4 votes to approve the increase in funding.‬

‭d.‬ ‭Discussed HS team sponsors for posters. Form has been posted to Facebook page. Checks can be‬
‭mailed to Marcy’s home address.‬

‭e.‬ ‭Track for Tournaments (Norski Invite & Conference) - Matt Bauer & Jagger Lokken on board.‬
‭Discuss reimbursing them for their time.  $250/Person/Tourney, $1000 total‬ ‭5 approvals were‬
‭obtained at meeting.‬

‭f.‬ ‭Is wrestling Room organization needed?‬‭Tyler to let‬‭us know if this is needed.‬

‭4.‬ ‭Gold Medal‬
‭a.‬ ‭Season Calendar - Attached‬

‭i.‬ ‭Practice breakdown: Add practice dates during Christmas break?‬‭Will work on this closer‬
‭to break.‬

‭ii.‬ ‭Youth Night confirmation with TRauls‬ ‭Chelsea proposed‬‭having youth night on Friday‬
‭1/17 after dual meet. This is the tournament wrestling weekend, the hope is to have‬
‭parents there to help with setting up for the weekend after the dual meet. Group agreed.‬

‭iii.‬ ‭1 Open Mat on the calendar‬‭Per age group. Kristine‬‭suggested having older kids at‬
‭younger age group mat night to show what wrestling is.‬

‭iv.‬ ‭Team pic date‬ ‭Still working on this.‬
‭b.‬ ‭Registration - 26 Sign up as of 10/15‬

‭i.‬ ‭4K-K= 7 | 1st-2nd=8 | 3rd-5th=11‬
‭c.‬ ‭Merch Store / Logo - use one of the many mock-ups Robin has done?‬‭Discussed team tshirt color,‬



‭not grey this year. And will use one of the previous logos Robin has designed. Sizes and numbers‬
‭from last year seemed to work well with number of registered kids, purple shirts this time.‬
‭Kristine to reach out to Josh with merch company for dates etc. Open 10/31?‬

‭d.‬ ‭Parents Meeting - Review topics/parent handout (attached)‬
‭e.‬ ‭Tournament‬

‭i.‬ ‭Medal Order‬‭Robin to order.‬
‭ii.‬ ‭Fee will be $30/wrestler‬

‭iii.‬ ‭Girls Division added‬
‭iv.‬ ‭Flier with Info sent to S&R‬
‭v.‬ ‭CAO started with early planning/communication - To-do list updated‬‭1/17 set up for‬

‭tournament, also youth night. Flier sent to Track Wrestling. Venmo set up.‬



Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>

Re: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update
1 message

Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com> Wed, Oct 23, 2024 at 9:22 AM
To: Robin Herring <rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>, Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>, Tyler Rauls
<tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>, Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>, Kristine Frye <kefrye86@gmail.com>, Dale Evans
<dale_e@evcoplastics.com>

That’s so exciting! Yes from me!

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Wednesday, October 23, 2024, 8:42 AM, Robin Herring <rob_dob_1@hotmail.com> wrote:

Exciting! It's a yes from me.

Robin

From: Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 8:12 AM
To: Tyler Rauls <tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>; Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>; Robin Herring
<rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>; Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>; Kristine Frye
<kefrye86@gmail.com>; Dale Evans <dale_e@evcoplastics.com>
Subject: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update
 
Hey Guys

Tyler and I had the chance to talk yesterday after his high school team meeting. The good news is that the
girls' team will be larger than he initially expected—possibly with a full roster!  We think purchasing 18
bundles will be best.  This will ensure they have a correctly sized uniform for each wrestler.

We voted "yes" to bundle 3: 12 bundles @ 164: $1,968

I motion that we increase it from 12 bundles to 18 bundles.  Total cost: $2,952.00

Tyler has signed up the team to work the concessions on November 1st which we discussed at our meeting
on Sunday.   He is also planning on doing the jerky fundraiser.  Robin has sent him the poster sponsorship
form that he will push his wrestlers to promote.  He has not been given a final number from Henert on what
the school will kick in, but still anticipating $500-$800.  These funds can be used to offset the additional cost
that Gold Medal will accrue. 

Please reply all with your vote.

Have a great day!
Chelsea 

10/23/24, 10:47 AM Gmail - Re: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=9d5480c98e&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:r4425390176289936429%7Cmsg-f:1813714955521044524… 1/1

UPDATED VOTE TO ORDER 18 UNIFORM BUNDLES: $2952.00

https://mail.onelink.me/107872968?pid=nativeplacement&c=Global_Acquisition_YMktg_315_Internal_EmailSignature&af_sub1=Acquisition&af_sub2=Global_YMktg&af_sub3=&af_sub4=100000604&af_sub5=EmailSignature__Static_
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I motion that we increase it from 12 bundles to 18 bundles. Total cost: $2,952.00





Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>

Re: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update
1 message

Kristine Frye <kefrye86@gmail.com> Wed, Oct 23, 2024 at 8:31 AM
To: Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>
Cc: Tyler Rauls <tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>, Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>, Robin Herring
<rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>, Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>, Dale Evans <dale_e@evcoplastics.com>

I vote yes.

Kristine Frye

On Wed, Oct 23, 2024, 8:13 AM Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com> wrote:
Hey Guys

Tyler and I had the chance to talk yesterday after his high school team meeting. The good news is that the girls' team
will be larger than he initially expected—possibly with a full roster!  We think purchasing 18 bundles will be best.  This
will ensure they have a correctly sized uniform for each wrestler.

We voted "yes" to bundle 3: 12 bundles @ 164: $1,968

I motion that we increase it from 12 bundles to 18 bundles.  Total cost: $2,952.00

Tyler has signed up the team to work the concessions on November 1st which we discussed at our meeting on
Sunday.   He is also planning on doing the jerky fundraiser.  Robin has sent him the poster sponsorship form that he will
push his wrestlers to promote.  He has not been given a final number from Henert on what the school will kick in, but
still anticipating $500-$800.  These funds can be used to offset the additional cost that Gold Medal will accrue. 

Please reply all with your vote.

Have a great day!
Chelsea 

10/23/24, 10:47 AM Gmail - Re: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=9d5480c98e&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:r4425390176289936429%7Cmsg-f:1813711762136851446… 1/1
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Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>

Re: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update
1 message

Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com> Wed, Oct 23, 2024 at 10:43 AM
To: Robin Herring <rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>, Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>, Tyler Rauls
<tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>, Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>, Kristine Frye <kefrye86@gmail.com>, Dale Evans
<dale_e@evcoplastics.com>

Yes from me. 

From: Robin Herring <rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 8:42 AM
To: Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>; Tyler Rauls <tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>; Korey Feiner
<koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>; Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>; Kristine Frye <kefrye86@gmail.com>;
Dale Evans <dale_e@evcoplastics.com>
Subject: Re: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update
 
Exciting! It's a yes from me.

Robin

From: Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 8:12 AM
To: Tyler Rauls <tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>; Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>; Robin Herring
<rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>; Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>; Kristine Frye <kefrye86@gmail.com>;
Dale Evans <dale_e@evcoplastics.com>
Subject: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update
 
Hey Guys

Tyler and I had the chance to talk yesterday after his high school team meeting. The good news is that the girls' team will
be larger than he initially expected—possibly with a full roster!  We think purchasing 18 bundles will be best.  This will
ensure they have a correctly sized uniform for each wrestler.

We voted "yes" to bundle 3: 12 bundles @ 164: $1,968

I motion that we increase it from 12 bundles to 18 bundles.  Total cost: $2,952.00

Tyler has signed up the team to work the concessions on November 1st which we discussed at our meeting on Sunday. 
 He is also planning on doing the jerky fundraiser.  Robin has sent him the poster sponsorship form that he will push his
wrestlers to promote.  He has not been given a final number from Henert on what the school will kick in, but still
anticipating $500-$800.  These funds can be used to offset the additional cost that Gold Medal will accrue. 

Please reply all with your vote.

Have a great day!
Chelsea 

10/23/24, 10:47 AM Gmail - Re: Vote Needed: HS Girls Merch Package Update
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Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>

Re: Gold Medal Registration
1 message

Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com> Wed, Oct 16, 2024 at 2:31 PM
To: Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>
Cc: Robin Herring <rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>, Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>, Tyler Rauls
<tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>, Kristine Frye <kefrye86@gmail.com>

Yes to bundle 3

On Wed, Oct 16, 2024 at 10:32 AM Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com> wrote:
Bundle 3 for me as well. 

From: Robin Herring <rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 6:41 PM
To: Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>; Tyler Rauls <tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>
Cc: Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>; Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>; Kristine Frye
<kefrye86@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Gold Medal Registration
 
I would be in agreement to do Bundle 3, as it should line up close to budget and hopefully covers girls
uniform expenses for the foreseeable future.

Robin

From: Nick and Marcy Hinz <hinz12@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 5:30 PM
To: Tyler Rauls <tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com>; Robin Herring <rob_dob_1@hotmail.com>
Cc: Chelsea Orvick <caorvick@gmail.com>; Korey Feiner <koreyfeiner@hotmail.com>; Kristine Frye
<kefrye86@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Gold Medal Registration
 
Looks good. I agree do it right in the beginning because hopefully the girls numbers will grow and all the uniforms will
get used! 

Marcy

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Tuesday, October 15, 2024, 12:25 PM, Tyler Rauls <tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com> wrote:

Good Afternoon Everyone! 

Finally have a chance to get a message out here— 

Wanted to reach out regarding our GIRLS WRESTLING UNIFORM package for the upcoming season. 

We have targeted this as one of our big needs and I believe we are ready to push the project across the
finish line. 

We can wait till our next meeting to discuss in detail but as always time is of the essence and the earlier I
can put the order in the better. 

10/16/24, 2:31 PM Gmail - Re: Gold Medal Registration
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Girls HS Uniform Bundle 3: $1968 approved via email
COrvick|KFeiner|MHinz|RHerring|KFrye

Girls HS Uniform 

mailto:koreyfeiner@hotmail.com
mailto:rob_dob_1@hotmail.com
mailto:hinz12@yahoo.com
mailto:tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com
mailto:caorvick@gmail.com
mailto:koreyfeiner@hotmail.com
mailto:kefrye86@gmail.com
mailto:hinz12@yahoo.com
mailto:tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com
mailto:rob_dob_1@hotmail.com
mailto:caorvick@gmail.com
mailto:koreyfeiner@hotmail.com
mailto:kefrye86@gmail.com
https://mail.onelink.me/107872968?pid=nativeplacement&c=Global_Acquisition_YMktg_315_Internal_EmailSignature&af_sub1=Acquisition&af_sub2=Global_YMktg&af_sub3=&af_sub4=100000604&af_sub5=EmailSignature__Static_
mailto:tyler.j.rauls@gmail.com
COrvick
Line



As a club we budgeted $1500 for this venture — my hope is that the school is going to come in around
$500-$1000.

My pricing log is as follows: 

Minimum order of 12 

Option one = $1416 
Option two = $1608
Option three = $1968 

My personal recommendation— do it right. Get bundle 3 at 12 pieces. Roughly $2000. Add 12 bags
whether under this budget or my upcoming general equipment budget 

12 bags @ 39 each = $468

Option 3 plus bags is about a $2,500 project. 

With some Goodluck it’s exactly what we budgeted for otherwise we may need to cover a few hundred
dollars if the school comes up short. 

Thoughts? Thank you and have a great day. 

Tyler 

Current designs with an update / tweak and decisions to be finalized 

10/16/24, 2:31 PM Gmail - Re: Gold Medal Registration

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=9d5480c98e&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1812296830377336520%7Cmsg-a:r2560429706574601428… 2/6

COrvick
Highlight

COrvick
Highlight
Option three = $1968





10/24/2024: Reviewed by CAOrvick





Gold Medal Wrestling Treasurer's Report 

Old National Bank Beginning Balance from 08/31/2024

Income (Deposits)
Date Description Amount

Expense - Old National Bank
Date Payable To Description Amount

Old National Bank Ending Balance as of 09/30/2024

Prepared for: 09/01/2024 - 09/30/2024
By: Marcy Hinz
For: Monthly Meeting

Current Period
Old National Bank 35,712.73
PayPal Balance 100.00
Cash on hand ($2K from Dale E. less 600 for Add'l $$ to instructors) 1,400.00

35,712.73

Notes
9/5/2024 Rudis MS Uniforms CAO - CC 3,802.22
9/3/2024 Amazon Scoreclock - MS CAO - CC 221.42

9/11/2024 USA Wrestling Club Charter & Add'l Insured CAO - CC 225.00
6/26/2024 Gabe McMahan USA Wrestling Coach Reimb Check 2757 50.00
9/10/2024 DeFo Football MH-check 2766 400.00

6/26/2024 John Zulkoski USA Wrestling Coach Reimb 50.00
Lovick Farms 4th Pig Cost 270.00

NONE

Reimbursement for Athletic traini

Total Account Balances 37,212.73

0.00

Total 4,698.64

31,014.09

Checks Not Cleared

320.00
Cash Used Notes 



Gold Medal Wrestling Budget 
Season: 8/1/2024-7/31/2025

Registration Income $ 6,000.00 $ -   $ 6,000.00
Tournament Weekend Deposit $ 20,000.00 $ -   $ 20,000.00
Regionals Tournament $ 5,000.00 $ -   $ 5,000.00
4th of July Pig Roast $ 2,000.00 $ -   $ 2,000.00
Meat Raffle $ 14,000.00 $ -   $ 14,000.00
HS Team Poster Sponsorship $ -   $ 1,200.00
HS State Tickets $ 1,755.00 $ -   $ 1,755.00
Norksi Camp ($20/Wrestler) $ 1,000.00 $ -   $ 1,000.00

4th of July Parade $ 600.00 $ -   $ 600.00
4th of July Pig Roast $ 3,000.00 $ -   $ 3,000.00
Regionals Tournament (DASD Hosting 2025) $ 3,000.00 $ -   $ 3,000.00
Gold Medal Banquets $ 1,100.00 $ -   $ 1,100.00
Meat Raffle $ 1,400.00 $ -   $ 1,400.00
Misc. Club Needs $ 350.00 $ -   $ 350.00
Operating Costs - Club Charter & Insurance $ 225.00 $ 225.00 $ -  
Operating Costs - TeamSnap (Annual Fee) $ 700.00 $ 599.00 $ 101.00
Operating Costs - WDFI Annual Report $ 50.00 $ 25.00 $ 25.00

$ 70.00 $ 70.32 $ (0.32)
Registration - Professional Reimb. Coaches $ 650.00 $ -   $ 650.00
Registration - Team shirts / Including Coaches $ 2,000.00 $ -   $ 2,000.00

$ 400.00 $ -   $ 400.00
Tournament - Medals $ 3,000.00 $ -   $ 3,000.00
Tournament Weekend (January) $ 9,500.00 $ -   $ 9,500.00
Tuesday Practice - Gabe & Austin $ 500.00 $ -   $ 500.00
Windsor/Deforest Baseball - Team Sponsor $ 250.00 $ -   $ 250.00

$ 180.00 $ -   $ 180.00

Banquet $ 600.00 $ -   $ 600.00
Uniforms (Team shirt, Pull over, Singlets) $ 3,850.00 $ 3,802.22 $ 47.78
Equipment Budget (Score Clock, Ankle Bands,
Mat Tape, Misc) $ 700.00 $ 266.72 $ 433.28
iPads (2) $ 800.00 $ 440.98 $ 359.02

Banquest (Food & Awards) $ 2,500.00 $ -   $ 2,500.00
Wrestling Room Signage $ 1,750.00 $ -   $ 1,750.00
Equipment Budget (Mat tape, etc) $ 1,000.00 $ 478.00 $ 522.00
Wrestler Posters $ 950.00 $ -   $ 950.00
Boys Singlets/Gear $ 1,200.00 $ -   $ 1,200.00
15 Wrestling Bags $ 600.00 $ -   $ 600.00
State Tickets $ 1,800.00 $ -   $ 1,800.00
Summer Wrestling League fees ($230 cash for
refs) + 50 from other team $ 180.00 $ -   $ 180.00
Norski Camp (Year 4) $ 2,800.00 $ -   $ 2,800.00
Girls Team Needs - Uniforms / Singlets
DASD will supply 10 singlets at $85 each $ 1,500.00 $ -   $ 1,500.00
Edge Fitness Training Program Contribution $ 400.00 $ 400.00 $ -  

Projected Income 2024-2025 $ 50,955.00
Projected Expense 2024-2025 $ 47,605.00

Current Income 2024-2025 $ -  
Current Expense 2024-2025 $ 6,307.24

Operating Costs - Website Hosting - Godaddy.com

State Qualifier Expenses (SS,T-Shirts, Tournament

Youth Night - $2 Concession Vouchers per wrestl

Reviewed & Approved: 08/14/2024

$ 1,200.00

Income
 2024-2025

Budgeted Income
 2024-2025

Actual Balance

Gold Medal 
 2024-2025
Budgeted Expense

 2024-2025
Actual Balance

Middle School 
 2024-2025
Budgeted Expense

 2024-2025
Actual Balance

High School 
 2024-2025
Budgeted Expense

 2024-2025
Actual Balance

Total Income $ 50,955.00 $ -   $ 50,955.00

Gold Medal Budget $ 26,975.00 $ 919.32 $ 26,055.68

Middle School Budget $ 5,950.00 $ 4,509.92 $ 1,440.08

High School Budget $ 14,680.00 $ 878.00 $ 13,802.00

2024-2025 Carry-Over $ 3,350.00

**This number does not reflect what DASD will allow for a wrestling budget for a 2024-2025 season.  This number could decrease based on that.


